
SOLICITATION NUMBER:
OPENING DATE:
OPENING TIME:
PROJECT MANAGER:
BUYER NAME:

Item 2              
Unit Price           

55 Gallon (buff color)

Item 3             
Unite Price         

56 Gallon (buff color) Total Bid Amount

$20.20 $21.10 $49,604.40

$20.05 $19.55 $48,596.22

$17.89 $18.49 $44,356.42

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$21.02 $2,047.00 $50,940.90

$18.95 $18.45 $45,921.60

$21.59 $21.03 $52,319.52

$20.90 $20.35 $50,643.90

Yes

Item 1          
Unit Price        

45 Gallon (clear)

BID RECAP
SOLICITATION TITLE: Waste Can Liners

IFB-4551-18-DH

Yes

Chris Packard

Central Poly Bag Corp.

Source Office & Technology

ConServ Flag Company

Interboro Packaging

7/25/2018
3:30pm

Duane Hoff Jr.

Company
Contractor's Bid 

Form
Acknowledged 
Addenda 1-2

Yes

No

$14.90

$14.29

$14.49

No Bid

L&N Supply Co., Inc.
Interline Brands, Inc. dba Supply 
Works

Veritiv

Western Paper

Apparent Low:

Amount:

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

No

Yes Yes

Yes

Addendum 1 ONLY

Yes

$15.20

$13.70

$15.60

$15.10


