Grand Junction

BID RECAP

SOLICITATION TITLE:

Aggregate and Road Material 2020

SOLICITATION NUMBERIFB-4331-17-DH

OPENING DATE: 4/9/2020

OPENING TIME: 3:30pm

PROJECT MANAGER: Dan Thorne

BUYER NAME: Duane Hoff Jr.

Acknowledged |Contractor's Di\l,tii?;f ;,‘;’-t-réitif,s. ltem #2 Streets Division 3/4" | Item #1 Water Division | Item #2 Water Division Iten;zﬁ \évri::ezi\gfion D;?::sm'?:r: glrj:r:?r
Company Addenda 1 Bid Form Ton Road Base - Ton 2" Class 5 Base - Ton | 3/4" Class 6 Base - Ton | Screened Rock - Ton [Crusher Fines/Trail Mix -

Elam Construction Yes Yes No Bid $11.50|No Bid $11.50 $14.27|No Bid
M.A. Concrete Construction, Inc. |[Yes Yes No Bid $10.50 $11.00 $11.00 $12.00 $22.50
Parkerson Construction, Inc. Yes Yes No Bid $13.50 $13.50 $13.50 $14.50 $22.90I
United Companies Yes Yes No Bid $15.10 $15.10 $15.10 $15.65|No Bid
\Whitewater Building Materials Corp[Yes Yes $28.00 $16.40 $16.40 $16.40 $16.90|No Bid

Apparent Low:

Amount:




